TABULATION

Bid #2008-451-1 Janitorial Equipment & Supplies

: Miller ‘Mayfield | Wagner Grainger
L ' EST | Paper Co. | Paper Co. Supply Nat'l Acct
PRODUCT REQUIRED aQrty Lbk/Ama Lbk/Ama Lbk/Ama -
2895.00
1 | Advance Micromatic M17B Walk-Behind Can not
Auto Scrubber (or equal) lea 3244.17 3629.03 3295.00 | meet spec
Advance Adfinity 20D Automatic 3790.00
2 | Scrubber w/ onboard detergent dispensing Can not
system (or equal) lea 4798.89 5972.09 488500 | meet spec
3 Advance Terra 28B Walk-behind
Sweeper (or equal) lea 2710.45 2742.66 2854.15 No bid
4 | Advance CarpeTwin 16XP (or equal) Tea 455.56 1178.18 862.34 596.50
*Alternate 568.83
5 ProTeam Quarter Vac w/ Attachment Kit
B (or equal) Sea 360.45 374.25 381.46 No Bid
*Alternate: Advance Agility 10XP 355.50
5 Advance AquaClean 16XP Self
Contained Extractor (or equal) lea 1832.69 2414.81 1544.67 1610.00
389.00
7 | Advance AquaSpot Carpet Spot Extractor Can not
(or equal) lea 602.13 677.14 628,40 | meet spec
8 | 44gal Brute container - Blue lea 46.20 43.84 37.65 39.90
9 | Janitor Cart Black RCP-673 (or equal) Sea 154.90 149.08 126.00 138.90
10 | 60" Quick Change Mophandle 8ea 6.05 6.31 5.98 5.98
Medium Synthetic blend, loop-end,
11 | Mopheads Unisan 592WH cs/12 (or
equal) 2cs 76.09 39.40 41.18 No Bid
12 | 20" Overall Ostrich Feather Duster 8ea 12.00 7.99 10.77 No Bid
13 Swivel Clip-On Handles UNS1490 (or
equal) 6ea 9.65 6.85 5.78 No Bid
14 | Frame 36" to fit Clip-On Handle 4ea 4.99 2.72 2.21 No Bid
15 | Frame 48" to fit Clip On Handle 2ea 7.13 3,22 2.67 No Bid
16 36X5 Disposable Dustmop Head
UNS1636 (or equal) beca 6.34 8.11 5.05 No Bid
17 48X5 Disposable Dustmop Head
UNS1648 (or equal) 2ea 8.80 10.60 6.58 No Bid
18 RCP-7777 Yellow Wavebrake Mopping
System lea 197.02 181.25 160,50 168.60
129.50
19 | RCP-7576-88 Yellow Wavebrake Can not
Mopping System Sea 162.78 151.25 134,11 | mest spec
20 | RCP-6374 Lobby Dust Pan Broom 8ea 6.19 8.21 5.05 5.64
10.47
21 Can not
RCP-2531 Lobby Dust Pan 8ea 16.33 15.23 13.53 | meet spec
22 | Unger QB220 Pro Bucket lea 22.95 25,84 21.40 22.90




Unger UP-45 Visa-Versa Washer w/

23 | Squeegee 2ea 33.13 32.51 23.66 24.85
24 | Unger ED900 OptiLoc Tele-Pole lea 87.67 80.65 63.26 91.50
25 | RCP-6310WHI Toilet Bowl Brush 12¢a 1.97 1.68 1.92 No Bid
26 | RCP-9W87 Yellow Brute Rim Caddy lea 47.32 49.24 38.84 41.20
27 | Phosphoric Acid Bowl Cleaner [2qt/cs lecs 28.80 21.67 30.12 No Bid

Neutral Disinfectant Floor Cleaner 6gl/cs
28 | Dilution ratio: End use

cost all 4x1 gl 2cs 87.68 91.67 35.40 No Bid

Conc. Glass Cleaner 6gl/cs Dilution
29 | ratio End use

cost all 4x1gl 2cs 41,37 44.55 68.55 No Bid

Non-Acid Bowl Cleaner 6gl/cs Dilution
30 | ratio; End use cost:

all 4x1g} 2cs 27.00 18.32 48.90 No Bid

31 | 320z Plastic bottles ea 36ea 91 .69 42 No Bid
32 | 320z Trigger Sprayers ea 36ea 61 72 52 No Bid
33 | Labels for Glass Clnr ea 12ea 0.0 0.0 0.0 No Bid
34 | Labels for Non-Acid Bowl Clnr 12ea 0.0 0.0 0.0 No Bid
35 | Labels for Disinf. Floor Cinr. Ea 12¢a 0.0 0.0 0.0 No Bid
36 Stainless Steel Clar & Polish aerosol

Cs/12 Ics 39,78 46.26 40.10 No Bid
37 | Yellow Flock-Lined Gloves Md/Lg/XLG | ea/pr 5.90 74 49 No Bid
38 General Purpose Vinyl Gloves Disposable

Bx/100 M/LG/XLG 2bx 3.40 3.85 435 No Bid
39 | Pumice Stone ea 12ea 1.75 2.26 1.47 No Bid
40 Scotch-Brite Medium-Duty Scrub Sponge 33.96

20/cs lcs 32.76 36.61 No Bid
41 | TOTALS: ALL | $14,673.88 | $2,031.45 | §3,625.76 $0.00




